RNI No. MAHENG/2000/35628 ____
Hog. Mo, South 34472011-13

HERTE IME- ST
FHTYRTT UAT S

wd ¢, A% ve(w)]  wiEw, @ v, sev/amE U3, Wty [y u, e : e ee.00

HAHTUOT HHEH %

PUEE L e
e PraremEeT atateaw 3 gt wemiee st swardw W sheter fafaoe amfm
ot 3 = e sl fadad (foeRt s

In pursuance of clause (3) of anicle 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations end Municipal Councils (Amendment) Act,
2012 {Mah. Act Mo, XVII of 2012), is hereby published under the authorty of the Govemnor

Bem, 111

Herar 11
of 1850,
Mah. XL
of 1065,

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashira,

H. B. PATEL.,
Secretary 0 Govermment,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO., XVII OF 2012,

{First published, afier having received the assemt of the (overnar, in the
“Maharashira Government Guzeffe®, on the i August 20020,

An Act further fo amend the Mumba: Municipal Corporation Act, the
Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City of
Nagpur Corperation Act, 1948 and the Mahareshira Municipal Councils,
Nogar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965,

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation Act, the Bombay Provinelal Municipal Corporations Act,
1949, the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965,

I - (x}



| HERTS TR TOANE WRIANVT WU W0, WU ¥, 9013/ SNEVT 13, W 1937

Bhort title

-

Amendment

-

o

for the purposes hminaﬁer_rﬁppeaﬁng; it is hersby enacted in the
Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER |
_"“ et J'L'E’i%:‘.im:ﬂ.t‘l_ﬁ'_.f v
1, This Act may be called the Maharachtra Municipal Corporations

and Muniﬁpal_ﬂuun.uﬂs AAmendment) Act, 2012,

CHAPTER 1I

AvErbmENTS 70 THE Minmar Momcman
CorRPORATION ACT.

"8, In'section 508 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation ﬂct'{fhare'ma.ﬂ.cr

of gecion 10 this Chapter referred to as “the Mumbai Corporation Aet™), in
508 of sub-section (2}, for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be
Bum. 11[.513: substituted, namely.—

“Provided that, the relative strength of the recogmized parties
or registered parties or groups or afhodi or front shall be caleulated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee. The number of Councillors of the

,recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front

shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures
gn arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registercd parties or groups or aghodi or front The
seats shall bé allotted to the recogmized parties or registered parties
or groups of aghad! or front by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the "same shall be allotied onme each to the recognized
parties or registered partiea or groups or aghadi or fromt in the
descending order of the fraction number im the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative
gtrength, till all the seats are allotted:™,

Amendment 3. In section 129A of the Mumbai Corporation Act, after the words
"flg';“:“n']_ and figares “under section 1257 the words, figures and letter “and

R

o af

estimates prepared by the General Manager under section 12647 shall

1ges. b inserted i

Amendment
of seclion

4604 of

Hom.

I of
1564,

4. In eection 460A of the Mumbai Corporation Act, after sub-section

{2}, the following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“{3) Where, any proposal of the General Manager requires the

, sanction . or approval of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and

Transport Committes or the corporation, the Brihan Mumbai Electrie
Supply and Transport Committes or, as the case mav be, the
corporation, shall consider and dispose of any such proposal within
forty-five daye in case of the =aid Committes and ninety davs in
case of the corporation, reckoned from the date of the meeting
of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and Transport Committee

Bom
1l of
1E8E.



WETITS, FEA TINGH SETSEI W TS, S0 W, RoR AT 93, W 0uaE

or, as the case may be, the corporation, held immediately after
the proposal is received by the Secretary of the said Committee
or as the case may be, the Municipal Secretary, whether the item
pertaining to such proposal is taken on agenda of such meeting
or not, failing which, sanction or approval to such proposal shall
be deemed to have been given by the Brihan Mumbai Electric
Supply and Transport Committee or, as the case may be, the
corporation, and a report to that effect shall be made by the General
Manager to the Government and it shall be lawful for the General
Manager to take further action as per the directives of the Government :

Provided that, any such deemed sanction or approval shall be
restricted to the extent the proposal conforms to the provigions
of this Act or any other law for the time being in force”.

5. In section 460K of the Mumbai Corporation Act—

(1) in clause (), for the words “ten lakhs rupees”™ the words
“hifty lakhs rupees™ shall be substituted ;

{2} in clause (d), for the words ~one lakh rupees " the words
“five lakhs rupees”™ shall be substituted.

8. In section 460L of the Mumbai Corperation Act, in the proviso,
after the words * Transport Committee ™ the words “or by two officers

of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and Transport Undertaking to

whom the powers have been delegated by the General Manager " shall

be added.

7. In section 460M of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section

{’HI-“ "

(1} for the words * fifty thousand rupees " the words * three lakhs
rupees " shall be substituted ;

i2) the following provise shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that, the notice of any tender for contract not
exceeding three lakhs rupees shall be uploaded on the official
website of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and Transport
Undertaking.”

8. In section 4600 of the Mumbai Corporation  Act,—

(1) in clause (a), for the words “two thousand rupees” the words
“ten thousand rupees” ghall be substituted :

(2) in clause (b), in the proviso, for the words ® fifteen thousand
rupees ” the words “ seventy-five thousand rupees " shall be substituted ;

(3} in elause (g)—

(i for the words “one lakh rupees” at the both places where
they occur, the words “five lakhs rupees” shall be substituted;

it} for the words * for any period ” the words * for any continuous
period” shall be substituted ;

{tit) for the words * ten thousand rupees * the words “fifty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

Pl EE—-gE-3

Amendment
of section
40K of
Bom. (01 of
1888,

Amendment
of saction
HG0L of
Bom. I of
1EBSE,

Amendment
of seckion
4608 alf
Bom. IIT of
1584,

Amendmaent
of section
4800 of
Bom. 10T of
1864,



Amendment

HERTE YA TTETH SRET Wi 3, S0 f, ¥oR/ s 1, T T

9, In section 460R of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section

of section /o) in the provise, for the words “four hundred rupees” the words

JEER of

Bom Ti of = ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted..

1888,
Amendment
of asstbon
4807 of
Bom. LI of
1885,

Amendoment
of sectinn
1148 of

¥

10. In =section 4680T of the Mumbai Corporation Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “four hundred rupees” the
words “ten thousand rupees® shall be substituted;

(2] in suh-gection (2), for the words “four hundred rupees” the
words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE BompBar Provincial NMUsiciead
Corrorations Act, 15948,

11. In section 31A of the Bombay Provineial Municipal Corporations

Act, 1949, in sub-section (2), for the frst proviso, the following provise

Bom. LI Shall be substituted, namely.—

of E949.

Aspendment

* Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties
or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front shall be caleulated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee, The number of Councillors of the
recoghized partics or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front
ghall be further divided by the gquotient of this divizion, The figures
so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registered parties of groups or aghadi: or fronl. The
seats shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or aghadi or front by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if ofne or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative
strength, till all the seats are allotted:"

CHAPTER IV

Amenoment ro THE Ty or Nacrur CorroraTion AcTt, 1948,
12. In section 40A of the City of Nagpor Corporation . Act, 1948,

of sectian in sub-section (2), for the first proviso, the following provise shall

40 of CP.

and Bepar D€- Substituted, namely:—

1 of 1850

“Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties
or registered parties or groups or aghodi or front shall be caleulated
by firat dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee, The number of Councillors of the
recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghodi or front
shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures

Bum

194

L. P.and
Berar [l
of 1950



UEATE WEA T SRR W 0, S W, SofR ST i, WE PRy

so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front. The
geata shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or aghadi or front by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength 8o ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative
stremgth, till alt the seats are allotted:"

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENT TO THE ManarasaTRa Mumicieal Couscins, Nacan
Pancaarars asn InovstmiaL Towssmies Act, 1965,

" Mah 18, In section 63 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nogar Amendment

ﬁ[{;ﬂgf Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (2B), % sector

" for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:- y; - jogs.
“Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties
or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front shall be calculated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee. The number of Councillors of the
recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghad: or front
shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures
so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registersd parties or groups or aghadi or fromt. The
seats shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or afhadi or [ront by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manmner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative

gtrength, Gl all the seats are allotted:™

0% BEFLALF OF GOWRIESSER T PRINTING, BTATIONERY AMD PURLICATION, PRENTED AND PUBLIEHED BY SHRI FARSHURAM JAGANHATH
GOSAVE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PREES, 214, HETAN SURHASH ROAL, CHARNI ROAD, MUAAL 400 (54 AND PUBLISHED
AT EHHECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRENTDNG. STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-4, METAJ SLBHASH ROAD, CHARN] ROAL, WAREL
400 04, EEHTOR - SHAD PASSHILTAAM JGARRATE GORAVL



